
JOY MCDOWELL, PRINCIPAL BUYER
DOMONIQUE ANDREWS, BUYER

ITEM QTY UOM UNIT PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE UNIT PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE UNIT PRICE
EXTENDED 

PRICE
UNIT 
PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE

UNIT 
PRICE

EXTENDED 
PRICE

1 EA
TANKER 
TRUCK

$2.45 $834,088.00 $2.54 $1,425.00 $18, 492.00 $1,479, 360

2 EA TOTES $4.0122 $10, 030.50 $1,425.00 $14, 250.00 $2,268.00 $22, 680.00

5. BRENNTAG-MID-
SOUTH

2. CHEMTRADE 
CHEMICALS US LLC

3. RESEARCH SOLUTIONS 
GROUP INC.

*For conversion purpose 
only. Price equates to 

$997.00.00/ton or 
$5.70/gallon (bulk)

NO BID

NO BID

*For conversion purpose 
only. Price equates to 

$444.00/ton or 
$2.537/gallon (bulk)

Ext. Total Calculation is 
based on 250 gallons per 
tote.* 10 EA=2,500 gals. 

$4.0122/gal* 2,500 
gals=$10,030.50 gals. 

NOTES

NOTES

4. NEO WATER 
TREATMENT

ITB-3-26 "POLYALUMINUM CHLORIDE"
E:MAIL: mcdowellj@jccal.org or andrewsdo@jccal.org
205-325-5662 or 205-325-5758

Formula: Polyaluminum 
hydroxychloride solution 
Aluminum Oxide: 16.8+/-
0.4%  Aluminum: 8.9+/-

0.15 Chloride: 21% 
minimum

1. USALCO

DESCRIPTION

Ext. Total Calculation is 
based on 250 gallons per 

truck. 80 EA=340.000 gals. 
$2.4532/gal=$834, 088.00

Formula: Polyaluminum 
hydroxychloride solution 
Aluminum Oxide: 16.8+/-
0.4%  Aluminum: 8.9+/-

0.15 Chloride: 21% 
minimum
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AMENDMENT 1 YES YES YES

2.  CHEMTRADE CHEMICALS US LLC/90 EAST HALSEY ROAD/SUITE 200/PARSIPPANY, NJ 07054/BRAD KEY/205-777-8957/E-MAIL: BKEY@CHEMTRADELOGISTICS.COM
3. RESEARCH SOLUTIONS/100 TONY HOLMES DRIVE/PELHAM,AL 35124/JOHN ACRES/205-663-6350/E-MAIL: JACRES@RESEARCHSOLUTIONSGROUP.COM
4. NEO WATER TREATMENT/8101 E. PRENTICE AVENUE, SUITE 325/GREENWOOD VILLAGE, CO 80111/SETH PATTERSON/205-229-7229/E-MAIL: SPATTERSON@NEOMATERIALS.COM
5. BRENNTAG MID-SOUTH 1405 HIGHWAY 136 WEST/HENDERSON, KY 42420/MELISSA SPARROW/270-869-5723/E-MAIL: MELISSA.SPARROW@BRENNTAG.COM

1. USALCO, LLC/2601 CANNERY AVENUE/BALTIMORE,MD 21226/TERRY WALDO E-MAIL: /BREE GALLIEN/205-243-9493/BGALLIEN@USALCO.COM     

YES

NO BID

YES

MANDATORY PRE-BID CONFERENCE ATTENDANCE YES YES
YES

*NO*

CONTACTS:

YES

AMENDMENT 2 YES YES YES

YES

*NO*

YES
YES
YES
YES
YES
YES
YES
YES

YES

YES
YES
YES
YES
YES

PRODUCT NUMBER
13555 (HYPER+ION 1197 

TOTES)
KEMIRA PAX-18 NO BIDULTRAPAC 1145

FINAL PRICE $844, 118.50 $876,830.00 $1,502,040.00 $3, 194, 867.00 NO BID

STATEMENT OF COMPLIANCE

YES
YES
YES

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT
AFFIDAVIT OF CONTRACTOR/E-VERIFY

YES
YES

YES
YES
YES

YES
YESEEOC STATEMENT

DEBARMENT STATEMENT

VENDOR VISIT -JAR TEST-EXHIBIT B YES

YES
YES
YES

YES
YES

YES
REQUIRED FORMS
NOTIFICATION OF INTENT TO RESPOND

PRICE SHEET

YES
YESSIGNATURE PAGE


	Sheet1

